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About Susan Tebos

Susan Tebos is a woman of incredible strength, resilience, and determination.
She has faced numerous challenges throughout her life, but has always managed
to emerge stronger than before. Her story serves as an inspiration to many,
reminding us that we all have the capacity to overcome obstacles and find
success.

Journey through Adversity

Susan's journey began in a small town, where she faced financial hardships from
an early age. Her parents struggled to make ends meet, leading Susan to
develop a strong work ethic and determination to create a better life for herself.
Despite the hardships, she excelled in school and earned a scholarship to a
prestigious university.
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However, tragedy struck during her second year of college when Susan lost both
her parents in a car accident. Devastated by this unimaginable loss, she
contemplated giving up on her dreams. But fueled by her parents' memory and
their unwavering belief in her, Susan persevered and completed her degree.

Career Success

After graduating, Susan faced additional challenges in finding employment. She
encountered numerous rejections and setbacks, which tested her resolve. But
Susan refused to give up and continued to apply for jobs, determined to build a
successful career.

Her persistence paid off when she landed a job at a renowned company. Susan
quickly rose through the ranks, showcasing her exceptional skills and dedication.
Within a few years, she was promoted to a leadership position, becoming an
influential figure in her field.

Empowering Others
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Throughout her career, Susan has never forgotten the struggles she faced.
Recognizing the importance of giving back, she initiated various empowerment
programs to help individuals facing adversity. From mentorship and motivational
speaking to financial assistance, Susan has become a beacon of hope for
countless people.

Through her work, Susan aims to inspire others to believe in themselves and their
abilities. She encourages them to overcome setbacks, set ambitious goals, and
chase their dreams. Susan firmly believes that everyone deserves a chance to
succeed, regardless of their background or circumstances.

Personal Life and Philanthropy

Beyond her professional achievements, Susan leads a fulfilling personal life. She
is a devoted mother to two children and a loving partner. Despite her demanding
career, she always finds time to spend with her family, prioritizing their well-being
and happiness.

In addition to her family life, Susan is actively involved in various philanthropic
endeavors. She supports several charitable organizations dedicated to causes
close to her heart, with a special focus on education and empowering
underprivileged individuals.

Inspiring the World

Susan Tebos's story is a testament to the power of resilience, determination, and
the human spirit. Her journey from adversity to success serves as an inspiration
to anyone facing challenges in their own lives. Susan's ability to rise above her
circumstances and create a meaningful life is a testament to the limitless potential
within each of us.



Through her advocacy, leadership, and philanthropy, Susan continues to
empower and change lives, proving that we can all make a positive impact on the
world. Her story reminds us that no matter how difficult our circumstances may
seem, with determination and a belief in ourselves, we too can overcome any
obstacles that come our way. We've been there, just like Susan Tebos.
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Candid, unfiltered stories about how it feels to be a teen adoptee

The teen years are full of uncomfortable self-discovery for everyone. But adopted
teens grapple with issues that make the coming of age journey immensely more
difficult. Many don't have words for what they're feeling, sensing, or believing
about themselves. They often don't have anyone like them to help them work
through their struggles. Forced to cope on their own, they end up feeling isolated.

Adoption advocate and adoptive mom Susan TeBos has watched her own
children go through these struggles. Often she wished for a voice that would
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resonate with adopted teens--her own and others--and authentically meet them
where they are.

She found not one voice, but many: over thirty adopted teens and young adults.
We've Been There gathers their stories, giving readers a front row seat to people
with similar stories and feelings.

This book is an unprecedented glimpse into the unfiltered feelings, thoughts,
experiences, and unanswered questions that well up in the heart of every person
with adoption in their story. From people who have been there as adopted kids,
this book not only invites adopted teens to bring their concerns into the open, but
also helps them process how they feel and offers them hope on the other side. In
these pages, teen adoptees will understand themselves in a whole new way and
find reassurance and a sense of belonging as part of a global adopted
community.
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