
We Can Be Mended: The Divergent Story
Continues

The Divergent series, penned by Veronica Roth, captured the hearts of millions of
readers around the world. The thrilling dystopian tale of Tris Prior's journey in a
divided society inspired a loyal following and left fans craving for more. Now,
years after the original trilogy concluded, Roth brings us "We Can Be Mended," a
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short story that reignites the excitement and ties up loose ends in the Divergent
universe.

The Power of "We Can Be Mended"

With the release of this short story, Roth reminds us why we fell in love with the
Divergent series in the first place. "We Can Be Mended" serves as an epilogue to
"Allegiant," the final book in the original trilogy, providing closure and answers to
the questions that lingered in readers' minds.
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In this story, we catch up with the surviving characters years after the explosive
events that reshaped their world. Tris's sacrifice and the revelation about the
existence of a world beyond the fence shattered everything they once knew. But
now, hope is rekindled as they embark on a journey towards mending their
divided society.

Character Development and Fan Expectations

One of the reasons why readers were drawn to the Divergent series was the
compelling characters that Roth created. In "We Can Be Mended," we witness
their growth and transformation even after the main storyline concluded. Four,
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Tris's love interest, must confront his inner demons and find a new purpose in this
fractured reality. Fans will be thrilled to see how their beloved characters continue
to evolve and adapt.

Moreover, "We Can Be Mended" discovers new corners of the Divergent
universe, expanding the story beyond the original trilogy. Through Roth's vivid
storytelling, we explore the uncharted territories of this dystopian society and gain
further insight into its inner workings.

The Impact on the Divergent Fandom

The release of "We Can Be Mended" has reignited the passion within the
Divergent fandom. Longtime fans who had resigned to the fact that the original
series came to an end are now buzzing with excitement. This short story offers
closure and a glimpse into a future readers had longed for. It's an opportunity to
revisit the characters they fell in love with and immerse themselves once again in
the Divergent universe.

For those who are new to the series, "We Can Be Mended" serves as a bridge
between the original trilogy and the potential future of the Divergent universe. It
showcases the power of unity, the impact of sacrifice, and the hope for a better
world.

: We Can Be Mended

Veronica Roth's "We Can Be Mended" gives fans everything they could hope for
and more. It delivers an emotional and satisfying to the Divergent series, while
leaving room for speculation and future exploration. This short story beautifully
ties up loose ends, offers character growth and development, and immerses
readers back into the captivating world they adore.



So, if you're a die-hard Divergent fan yearning for more, or a newcomer looking
for an enthralling dystopian series, "We Can Be Mended" is a must-read. Dive
back into the world of factions, courage, and resilience, and join the countless
readers who believe in the power of unity and the hope for a mended society.
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Globally bestselling author Veronica Roth returns to the world of Divergent in this
revealing short-story epilogue that takes place five years after the stunning
events of Allegiant.

As Tobias struggles to understand and move past his fears, the world he once
knew has changed beyond recognition. Fringe-dwellers, ex-faction members,
Bureau dropouts, and migrants now coexist in the rebuilt streets of Chicago.

It’s a new, better world—one where he isn't sure how to belong. As everyone else
seems to move forward, Tobias is still haunted by those who couldn’t. But new
connections from old friends help him begin to heal—and mend.

And don't miss The Fates Divide, Veronica Roth's powerful sequel to the
bestselling Carve the Mark!
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