
Jesus Taught In Parables: Three Bible Stories
For Children
Throughout history, Jesus Christ has been regarded as one of the most influential
spiritual leaders. His teachings have touched the hearts of millions, and one
powerful tool he used to convey his messages was through parables. Parables
are simple stories with profound meanings that Jesus used to teach important
lessons. In this article, we will explore three Bible stories for children, where
Jesus imparted his wisdom and love through parables.

1. The Parable of the Lost Sheep

In this parable, Jesus tells the story of a shepherd who had a hundred sheep. The
shepherd loved and cared for his sheep dearly. However, one day, he discovered
that one of his sheep had gone missing. Without hesitation, the shepherd left the
ninety-nine other sheep in the field and went in search of the lost sheep.

The Parable of the Lost Sheep teaches children the importance of compassion
and empathy. It shows them that Jesus is like the shepherd who always looks out
for us, even if we wander away. Just like the shepherd rejoices when he finds the
lost sheep, Jesus rejoices when a sinner repents and returns to him.
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Through this story, children learn that they are never alone, and Jesus is always
there to guide and protect them. They understand the significance of staying
close to Jesus and responding to his call.

2. The Parable of the Prodigal Son

The Parable of the Prodigal Son is one of the most beloved stories told by Jesus.
It is a tale of forgiveness, redemption, and unconditional love. The story begins
with a younger son who selfishly asks for his inheritance from his father. The
father, heartbroken, grants his request. The son then squanders the wealth in
reckless living and ends up destitute.

Realizing his mistake, the son decides to return to his father, confessing his
wrongdoings and asking for forgiveness. While the son is still far away, his father
sees him and runs towards him, embracing him with open arms. The father's love
and forgiveness bring tears of happiness to the son's eyes.

This parable teaches children the transformative power of forgiveness and the
never-ending love of God. It reminds them that no matter how far they may stray
or how many mistakes they make, God's love is always waiting for them, ready to
welcome them back with open arms.

3. The Parable of the Good Samaritan

In the Parable of the Good Samaritan, Jesus tells the story of a man who is
attacked by robbers on his way to Jericho. Several individuals, including a priest
and a Levite, pass by the wounded man without offering any help. However, a
Samaritan, who was despised and considered an outcast by society, stops and
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tends to the injured man's wounds. He takes the man to an inn, pays for his stay,
and promises to cover any additional expenses.

This powerful parable teaches children the importance of showing kindness,
compassion, and love to everyone, regardless of their background. It challenges
them to go beyond societal prejudices and embrace the value of helping those in
need. Just as the Samaritan selflessly cared for the wounded man, Jesus calls
children to love their neighbors and treat them with empathy and understanding.

Jesus' parables continue to inspire and guide children today. Through these
stories, children learn valuable lessons about love, forgiveness, compassion, and
empathy. The Parable of the Lost Sheep emphasizes Jesus' unwavering love and
care for his followers. The Parable of the Prodigal Son teaches children the
transformative power of forgiveness and the unconditional love of God. Lastly, the
Parable of the Good Samaritan challenges children to embrace kindness and
empathy towards everyone they encounter.

By sharing these Bible stories with children, we help them understand the
teachings of Jesus and instill in them the values that he exemplified. The
parables serve as a powerful tool to engage their hearts and minds, allowing
them to grow in faith and reflect the love of Jesus in their own lives.
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Jesus taught in parables or stories with important moral lessons hidden in them.
In this book, you will read about three parables: the parable of the good
samaritan, the parable of the sower, and the parable of the mustard seed. What
lessons did you learn from them? Don’t forget to answer the guide questions after
each parable to test your understanding.
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