
Field Manual FM 97 FM 90 Mountain
Operations November 2000: A Comprehensive
Guide to Mountain Warfare

Mountain warfare is a unique aspect of military operations that requires
specialized skills and knowledge. Field Manual FM 97 FM 90 Mountain
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Operations November 2000 serves as a comprehensive guide for soldiers and
commanders engaged in mountain warfare. This field manual provides valuable
insights, tactics, and techniques to successfully overcome the challenges of
operating in mountainous terrain.

Understanding the Importance of Mountain Operations

The world is not a uniform flat surface, and military operations often take place in
diverse landscapes. Mountains present a distinctive set of obstacles and
advantages for military forces. From strategic and tactical perspectives,
understanding and effectively utilizing mountain operations can significantly
influence the outcomes of conflicts.
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Field Manual FM 97 FM 90 Mountain Operations November 2000 delves into the
significance of mountain warfare and its relevance in contemporary military
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strategies. From studying the effects of elevation on human performance to
analyzing the impact of weather conditions in mountainous regions, this manual
covers a wide array of crucial aspects.

Key Topics Covered in Field Manual FM 97 FM 90 Mountain
Operations November 2000

This comprehensive field manual covers various critical topics related to
mountain warfare. It offers insights into terrain analysis, route planning, defensive
and offensive operations, logistics, and much more. Moreover, it provides detailed
descriptions of equipment, tools, and technologies that aid in mountain
operations.

Terrain Analysis

Understanding the terrain is paramount in mountain warfare. This manual
emphasizes the importance of terrain analysis by providing guidelines on
evaluating slopes, identifying chokepoints, selecting observation positions, and
analyzing potential firing positions.

Route Planning

Navigating through mountains can be particularly challenging. Field Manual FM
97 FM 90 Mountain Operations November 2000 extensively covers route
planning, focusing on identifying suitable paths, assessing obstacles, planning for
supply and reinforcement routes, and managing key points along the route.

Defensive and Offensive Operations

Mountain operations involve not only defending positions but also conducting
offensive actions when necessary. This field manual provides guidance on
establishing defensive positions, conducting patrols, executing ambushes, and
executing assaults in mountainous terrain.



Logistics

Supplying and maintaining forces in mountainous regions present unique
challenges. Field Manual FM 97 FM 90 Mountain Operations November 2000
discusses logistical considerations such as transportation, resupplying,
evacuation procedures, medical support, and establishing mountain bases.

The Advantages of Mountain Operations

Despite the challenges posed by mountain warfare, it also offers significant
advantages when utilized effectively. Mountainous terrain can provide natural
cover, impede enemy movements, provide opportunities for surprise attacks, and
allow troops to utilize elevated positions for better observation. Field Manual FM
97 FM 90 Mountain Operations November 2000 provides insights on how to
exploit these advantages to gain superiority in mountain operations.

The Historical Significance of Mountain Warfare

Throughout history, mountainous regions have been the battleground for
numerous conflicts. From the Alps to the Himalayas, the outcomes of wars have
been determined by the mastery of mountain warfare tactics. This field manual
highlights influential battles and showcases historical examples where mountain
operations have played a decisive role.

Field Manual FM 97 FM 90 Mountain Operations November 2000 is a vital
resource for soldiers and commanders engaged in mountain warfare. By
providing comprehensive guidance, tactical insights, and historical context, this
manual equips military personnel to navigate the challenges and exploit the
advantages presented by mountainous terrain. Whether in training or active
operations, this field manual is an indispensable tool for anyone involved in
mountain warfare.
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FM 3-97.6 describes the tactics, techniques, and procedures that the United
States (US) Army uses to fight in mountainous regions. It is directly linked to
doctrinal principles found in FM 3-0 and FM 3-100.40 and should be used in
conjunction with them. It provides key information and considerations for
commanders and staffs regarding how mountains affect personnel, equipment,
and operations. It also assists them in planning, preparing, and executing
operations, battles, and engagements in a mountainous environment.Army units
do not routinely train for operations in a mountainous environment. Therefore,
commanders and trainers at all levels should use this manual in conjunction with
TC 90-6-1, Army Training and Evaluation Program (ARTEP) mission training
plans, and the training principles in FM 7-0 and FM 7-10 when preparing to
conduct operations in mountainous terrain.
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