
Bury Me In My Jersey: The Undying Passion
of Sports Fans That Defines Identity

Sports have long been an integral part of human culture and society. From
ancient civilizations engaging in competitive games to modern-day stadiums filled
with passionate fans, the love for sports runs deep within us. As sports
enthusiasts, we often find ourselves so engrossed in the game that it becomes an
inseparable part of our identity. In "Bury Me In My Jersey" by Tom McAllister, this
fascinating bond between sports and personal identity is thoughtfully explored.

"Bury Me In My Jersey" is not just a book about sports; it delves into the
emotional connection fans develop with their favorite teams and players. It
encapsulates the dedication, sacrifice, and unwavering support that sports fans
demonstrate, making it more than just a hobby. Through heartfelt anecdotes,
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McAllister explores the concept of "burying oneself" in the jersey, symbolizing the
deep passion and allegiance fans feel towards their team.
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The Essence of Sports Fandom: A Ritualistic Bond

Every fan has their own unique story of how sports became an integral part of
their life. "Bury Me In My Jersey" captures the essence of this narrative by
showcasing the diverse experiences and rituals associated with fandom. From
pre-game rituals to superstitions during a match, sports fandom becomes a
ritualistic bond that connects individuals across generations and cultural
boundaries. The book celebrates these rituals and highlights their significance in
shaping personal identity.
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Sports as a Vehicle for Emotional Expression

Throughout history, sports have been a powerful outlet for emotional expression.
In "Bury Me In My Jersey," McAllister examines how sports fandom serves as a
vehicle for fans to channel their emotions, both in moments of triumph and defeat.
It explores the joy, heartbreak, and camaraderie that comes with being a sports
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fan, offering a deeper understanding of the emotional rollercoaster that fans
willingly embark upon.

Identity Formation: The Fan Identity

How does being a sports fan shape our identity? "Bury Me In My Jersey" delves
into this intriguing question by exploring the ways in which fans construct their
own identity around their favorite teams and players. With personal anecdotes
and relatable experiences, the book captures the process of identity formation
that occurs through sports fandom. It reveals how being a fan becomes an
integral part of who we are, influencing various aspects of our lives, from social
interactions to personal values.

The Community Aspect: Building Bonds and Belonging

Sports fandom brings people together, forging a sense of belonging within a
community of like-minded individuals. In "Bury Me In My Jersey," this aspect is
brought to the forefront, showcasing the power of community support and the
unbreakable bonds forged through shared passion. From tailgating parties to fan
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clubs, the book emphasizes the role of sports as a catalyst for forming
connections and fostering a sense of unity among fans.

"Bury Me In My Jersey" is more than just a book; it is a celebration of the undying
passion and identity that sports fans embody. Through personal stories,
emotional narratives, and insightful analysis, Tom McAllister explores the
profound impact of sports fandom on individuals and communities. This book
serves as a reminder of the remarkable power of sports to transcend boundaries
and shape our personal identity.
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Born and raised in Eagles country, Tom McAllister learns from his father and
brother the rules of being a football fan. Spending Sundays in the infamous 700
level of Veterans Stadium, or sitting in front of the TV with his father in a nearby
recliner, Tom sees both the ugly and beautiful sides of Philadelphia football. Like
all true Philadelphians, he connects with the players. From icons Chuck Bednarik
and Steve Van Buren to modern-day greats Randall Cunningham, Donovan
McNabb, and Brian Dawkins and controversial stars such as Terrell Owens, the
Eagles players become a part of McAllister’s life. Watching them every Sunday,
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he tries to develop his own identity as a fan. Torn between his father’s calm and
levelheaded fandom and the rowdy, profane, and violent crowds of Philadelphia
legend, Tom struggles to achieve balance. 

As a rabid Eagles fan, Tom McAllister experiences plenty of defeats and
disappointments, but his biggest challenge is coping with the premature loss of
his father to cancer. In Bury Me in My Jersey, McAllister explores the connection
between his dedication to the Eagles and the death of his father. He details the
intense bonds—between fathers and sons, among friends, and even between a
city and its football team—and chronicles the joys and sorrows, victories and
failures, of a lifetime of sports obsession.

Any fan can relate: Tom drinks to excess, spends countless hours every week
posting to an online Eagles message board, and spies on players in the fruit aisle
of the supermarket. Without the example of his father to guide him, Tom often
finds himself stumbling off track. But it is his girlfriend and eventual wife,
LauraBeth, who keeps him grounded as he matures into adulthood.

A touching, funny, beautifully crafted memoir, Bury Me in My Jersey is not only a
marvelous tribute to a father, a way of life, and a team and its devoted followers
but also a love letter to the city of Philadelphia.
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